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MDOT 21aa Limestone 4500 tons  $                10.15  $           4.95 NA  $     10.55  $           5.00 NA 10.40 6.00  $           3.00  $   11.50  $               5.50  $                11.00  $     11.50  $           5.99 NA

MDOT 23a 2000 tons  $                10.15  $           4.95 NA  $        9.80  $           5.00 NA 10.40 6.00  $           3.00  $   11.50  $               5.50  $                11.00  $     11.50  $           5.99 NA

MDOT 3” x 1” Course

Aggregate
300 tons  $                11.90  $           4.95 NA  $     10.50  $           5.00 NA 12.00 6.00  $           3.00  NA  $     13.00  $           5.99 NA

4” x 8” Limestone Rip

Rap
250 tons  $                19.45  $           4.95 NA  $     15.25  $           5.00 NA 12.00 8.50  $           4.75  $   21.45  $               5.50  $                11.00  $     24.00  $           8.99 NA

8” x 16” Limestone Rip

Rap
50 tons  $                26.00  $           5.50 NA  $     28.25  $           6.00 NA 28.00 8.50  $           4.75  $   28.27  $               5.50  $                11.00  $     34.00  $         11.49 NA

16” x 24” Limestone Rip

Rap
50 tons  No Bid  No Bid NA  $     28.25  $           6.00 NA 32.00 8.50  $           4.75  $   33.00  $               7.50  $                15.00  $     36.00  $         11.49 NA

18” x 24” Limestone Rip

Rap
50 tons  $                26.00  $           5.50 NA  $     28.25  $           6.00 NA No Bid No Bid No Bid  $   33.00  $               7.50  $                15.00  $     36.00  $         11.49 NA

6A MDOT Limestone

Washed
500 tons  $                12.60  $           4.95 NA  $     12.00  $           5.00 NA 22.50 7.25  $           3.50  $   25.58  $               4.50  $                  9.00  $     14.00  $           7.99 NA

2MS Masonry Sand 50 tons  $                  8.85  $           5.45 NA  $        8.50  $           7.00 NA 9.00 7.00  $           3.50  $     8.85  $               5.50  $                11.00  $       8.50  $           8.49 NA

2NS Sand 1500 tons  $                10.25  $           4.95 NA  $        9.75  $           5.00 NA 10.75 4.25  $           2.00  $   14.85  $               5.00  $                10.00  $       6.00  $           7.49 NA

Topsoil 350 tons  $8.00 Per Yard 
 $6.25 Per 

Yard 
NA  $        9.50  $           6.00 NA 10.00 4.25  $           2.00  $   12.10  $               5.50  $                11.00  $     10.00  $           8.35 NA

Class II Sand 5000 tons  $                  4.50  $           5.45 NA  $        4.50  $           7.00 NA 5.50 4.25  $           2.00  $     4.13  $               8.25  $                16.50  $       4.00  $           6.99 NA

Spoils Haul Out 6500 tons  $           6.50 FU Dump  $           6.85 Ellsworth $ 9.00 Misc  $   23.82  $               6.85  $13.70 Landfill  $ 7.99 Misc 

Concrete Haul Out As Needed  $           7.50 FU Dump  $           6.00 Ellsworth $ 9.00 Misc  $         -    $             10.00  $20.00 Landfill  $ 9.99 Misc 

Street Sweepings As Needed   $           6.50 Advanced Landfill  $     11.00  $           8.00 E Sauk Trail No Bid No Bid No Bid  $   10.19  $               6.85  $ 13.70 Misc  $ 8.99 Misc 

Asphalt Haul Out As Needed  $           6.50 FU Dump  $           7.50 $3.00 Haas Rd. $ 9.00 Misc  $         -    $             10.00 $ 20.00 Misc  $ 8.99 Misc 


