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Recreation GameTime Cemrock Superior Play

Concrete log crawl 

tunnel, concrete $3,449.00 $3,513.00 $8,064.00 $5,940.00 $7,130.00 $6,655.00

Concrete log balance 

beam $3,923.00 $3,215.00 $5,167.00 $2,356.00 $6,470.00 $3,075.00

Concrete log steppers $2,697.00 $1,830.00 $4,738.00 no bid $2,300.00 $3,230.00

Concrete turtle $6,395.00 $6,575.00 $7,788.00 no bid $3,950.00 $10,450.00

Concrete ducks no bid $9,675.00 no bid no bid $2,900.00 $18,980.00

Concrete frog no bid $6,295.00 $9,173.00 no bid $3,950.00 $8,600.00

concrete geese no bid $7,890.00 no bid no bid $5,350.00 $9,900.00

concrete muskrat no bid $7,869.00 no bid no bid $4,440.00 $8,000.00

Nature themed climber no bid see below no bid $4,121.00 no bid $1,815.00

Seated spinners no bid $5,824.00 no bid $1,084.00 no bid $2,050.00

nature themed seats - 

mushrooms $5,787.00 $1,947.00 $5,349.00 $1,668.00 $3,110.00 $2,520.00
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